
Buyer:  Clinton Paul ITB 6863 OF
State of Nebraska Print Shop 

Opening Date:  3-28-24

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 18 X 12 X 12 PACKING BOX
GLUED PLAIN 1200 EA  $          1.3400  $          1,608.0000  $          5.0000  $              6,000.0000 

2 4.75 X 3.5 X 2 BUSINESS CARD
FOLDING BOX WITH LID FOLD FLAT 1200 EA  $          1.0200  $          1,224.0000  no bid 

3 7.25 X 3.75 X 2 1/16 BUS CARD
FOLDING BOX WITH LID FOLD FLAT 4000 EA  $          1.0300  $          4,120.0000  no bid 

4 8.5 X 11 X 2 LETTERHEAD 
FOLDING BOX FOLD FLAT 4000 EA  $          1.1534  $          4,613.6000  no bid 

5 8.5 X 11 X 4 LETTERHEAD 
FOLDING BOX FOLD FLAT 3000 EA  $          1.8112  $          5,433.6000  no bid 

6 15.5 X 12.5 X 10.5 STORAGE BOX 10000 EA  $          1.9400  $        19,400.0000  $          2.3400  $            23,400.0000 
7 16.5 X 13 X 2 STORAGE BOX LID 10000 EA  $          0.6400  $          6,400.0000  $          1.2100  $            12,100.0000 

8 11.25 X 8.75 X 10.5 CARTON 
32ECT 33LB MED 5000 EA  $          0.8300  $          4,150.0000  $          1.9500  $              9,750.0000 

9
% DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG/PRICE 
LIST FOR OTHER CORRUGATED
BOXES/CARTONS

100000 %  N/A  N/A 20%

10
% DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG/PRICE
LIST FOR OTHER
CHIPBOARD BOXES/CARTONS

100000 %  N/A  N/A 20%

 $        46,949.2000  $            51,250.0000 
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